
Loveless Family Farms 
 Health Guarantee 

 
Please note that every effort has been made to insure that your puppy is in excellent health.  
However, any time a puppy is moved to a new environment, it does cause stress.  When a 
puppy is under stress, it may cause minor digestive or respiratory upset.  Please watch your 
puppy for any symptoms for at least the first 72 hours following travel.  If any symptoms appear, 
please contact your Veterinarian. 
  
This agreement is for the benefit and protection of the Buyer and Seller.  No modifications of this 
agreement shall be valid unless they are in writing and are signed by both the Buyer and the 
Seller.  It is the Buyer’s responsibility to have the puppy examined by a licensed practicing 
Veterinarian within 48 HOURS (excluding weekends) of delivery.  Failure to do so will deem this 
Guarantee null and void. 
   
This puppy is guaranteed for one year from date of birth against fatal and life altering congenital 
disease which adversely affects the health of the animal and causes problems of a severe life 
threatening or altering nature.  If the puppy dies within this one-year time frame, the Buyer will 
pay to have it autopsied to ascertain reason.  If death was caused by a congenital condition the 
puppy will be replaced with a puppy of equivalent value. 
    
Seller will not be responsible for any medical expenses incurred upon sale of this puppy.  Buyer 
is aware that owning a puppy means trips to the Veterinarian and understands that he/she will 
be responsible for all medical expenses. 
   
Puppies, like children, are susceptible to pneumonia and other infections due to drafts, cold 
temperatures, etc.  These conditions are the responsibility of the Buyer.  As of the date of 
delivery, we have cared for your puppy under the advice and guidelines of our Veterinarian.  
Puppies have received all age appropriate vaccinations and dewormings.  This guarantee does 
not include Coccidia, Giardia, and any parasitic presence; these conditions occasionally occur 
regardless of the level of care that has been given.  This guarantee does not include Kennel 
Cough.  Kennel Cough is self-limiting and like the common cold, it must run its course.  Full 
recovery is expected and Kennel Cough on its own is not life threatening.  This guarantee does 
not include Hypoglycemia (low blood sugar).  Hypoglycemia and other conditions may occur if 
the puppy does not eat or if it becomes cold, overheated or becomes ill or stressed.        
 
There are certain disorders that may be caused by environmental factors, for example: allergies, 
thyroid dysfunction, demodectic mange, and other autoimmune disorders that are not covered 
by this guarantee.  This guarantee does not cover accidental death or any physical problem, 
which is or could be the result of injury.   
 
COAT CONDITIONS VARY WITH DIFFERENT COLORS!  Some colors are more sensitive 
than others.  At times, poor nutrition causes hair loss and/or dry skin.  Also, stress and 
environmental factors the puppy may be exposed to after purchase can causes such problems.  
Blue dogs in other breeds sometime have a harmless progressive hairloss called blue dog 
alopecia.  Loveless Family Farms cannot guarantee the coat because of matters such as these.               
NOTE:  None of our puppies have ever exhibited any of these skin problems. 
 



All items covered under this guarantee are by replacement only.  There will be NO CASH 
REFUNDS.  This contract is null and void if the terms and conditions are not fulfilled.  
 
A puppy showing any serious genetic or congenital defect will be replaced as follows:  Puppy 
must show the defect by one year of age.  The Seller must be notified of the problem within (2) 
business days after determination of the condition by a licensed practicing Veterinarian.  A 
second opinion from an unassociated Veterinarian stating the same issue is required before 
Seller is obligated to replace the original puppy.   
 
A puppy with a defect must be returned or humanly euthanized with the prior permission of the 
Seller to qualify for a replacement puppy.  A returned puppy must be returned to the Seller in 
good condition, other than the specified problem, at the expense of the Buyer and with all 
original paperwork.  Only then will the Buyer qualify for a replacement puppy.   Buyer is 
responsible for transportation costs to return the original puppy to the Seller and for shipping the 
replacement puppy from the Seller to the Buyer.  This guarantee applies to the original Buyer 
only and is nontransferable to a second party.  No replacement puppy will be given if the puppy 
has been euthanized without permission of the Seller.  Replacement puppy will be of 
comparable quality and same sex upon availability.  It is understood that the replacement puppy 
may not be from the exact same parents as original puppy.  
 
Above all Loveless Family Farms guarantees a healthy pet, but we do not guarantee size, 
weight, height at maturity, color, ear structure, conformation and overall structure; however, we 
strive to breed for all of these to be a the highest level.  There is no guarantee or warranty that 
the Buyer will be able to show or breed the puppy regardless of show or breeding potential.   
 
This contract is under the jurisdiction of the State of Oklahoma, and the county of Logan.  It is 
mutually understood and agreed that any legal issues or court proceedings concerning this 
puppy purchase will be resolved in Logan County, Oklahoma where the sale originated.  
Furthermore, this is extending to Internet sales across state lines.   
 
Buyer’s signature below indicates that he/she has read, agrees, and does understand ALL the 
conditions of the contract. 
 
 
Date: _________________ 
 
 
 
Printed Name of Buyer: ___________________ Signature of Buyer: ______________________ 
 
 
 
Printed Name of Seller: ___________________ Signature of Seller:______________________ 
 
 
 


